

1155 Brewery Park Blvd, Ste 200 Detroit, Michigan 48207 313-446-1530 Tax I.D. 38-1879991

Invoice 646189

June 18, 2025

Charles Widmaier Tyrone Township 123 Brighton Lake Rd., Ste. 205 Brighton, MI 48116

Re: In Re: Chris Ropeta

Claim #:

Client 8126 Matter 1

For Legal Services Rendered Through 5/31/2025

Date	Timekpr	Description of Services Performed	Hours
05/07/25	JJG	Correspondence from / to Clerk Pam Moughler regarding approval of law firm	.20
05/07/25	IJG	Correspondence from / to Treasurer Jennifer Eden regarding statements made during public hearing	.20
05/07/25	JJG	Lengthy correspondence from Trustee Sara Dollman-Jersey regarding response to claim filed by Mr. Ropeta	.30
05/07/25	JJG	Review and analysis of Complaint filed by Chris Ropeta	.40
05/08/25	JJG	Correspondence from / to Attorney for Mr. Ropeta, Nick Curcio, regarding newly filed Complaint	.20
05/08/25	JJG	Review and analysis of newly filed Complaint	.30
05/14/25	JJG	Preparation of Answer to Complaint for Order of Superintending Control together with Affirmative and/or Special Defenses	2.40
05/14/25	WDUFF	Research township website for the purpose of obtaining relevant Tyrone Board Township meeting minutes, agendas, and audio/visual recordings.	.40
05/14/25	WDUFF	Review Plaintiff's Plaintiff's February 24, 2025 Complaint, Defendant's Response, Court's Opinion and Order, and May 2, 2025 Complaint for the purpose of preparing Defendant's Brief in Opposition of Injunctive Relief.	1.70
05/15/25	JJG	Draft correspondence to Township Clerk Pam Moughler regarding preparation and filing of Answer to Complaint and request for meeting	.60
05/15/25	JJG	Preparation of Affirmative and/or Special Defenses	1.10
05/20/25	JJG	Telephone call from Township Attorney regarding Board meeting and need for update	.10
05/21/25	BTIGA	Discussion with attorney John Gillooly regarding case strategy, procedural posture, and additional briefing to be conducted at a later date by court order.	.30
05/21/25	BTIGA	Analyze case opinions as cited by Ropeta in his complaint and principal case on standard of the charges against him with notes to be used in eventual written response.	.60
05/21/25	BTIGA	Analyze Ropeta's complaint and attached exhibits and affidavit with notes on Ropeta's eventual arguments and legal and factual support in advance of eventual substantive written response to Ropeta's claim for superintending control.	1.10
05/21/25	JJG	Conference with appellate specialist Benjamin Tigay regarding strategy going forward	.30

In Re: Chris Ropeta 06/18/25

Total Hours	10.20
Total Value of Services	\$3,307.50

Time Summary by Timekeeper	Hours	Amount
Benjamin Tigay	2.00	700.00
John J. Gillooly	6.10	2,135.00
William Duffield	2.10	472.50

Costs Advanced:

Date	Description	Amount
04/15/25	Fee to John J. Gillooly for Mileage Charge - 117.4 miles from 1155 Brewery Park Blvd, Detroit, MI 48207, USA to 8420 Runyan Lake Rd, Fenton, MI 48430, USA - Return Trip - Attendance at Public Hearing	82.18
	Total Costs Advanced	\$ 82.18
	Total Due This Invoice	\$3,389.68

Invoices for legal services are due upon receipt. To ensure proper application of your payment, please indicate our invoice number and client/matter number on your remittance.